BIDS OPENED SEPTEMBER 21, 2015 @ 2:30 P.M. FOR FY 2015-2016

Page
Bid No.
2016-01 Asphalt Cold Mix Adv Asphalt Cold Mix MidSouth Whitehead
Products Inc. Paving Construction
Cold Patch - Stone 98.00 98.20 No Bid 131.50
Cold Patch - Slag No Bid No Bid 115.00 984.00
2016-02 Polyethylene Pipe Harvey Southern Pipe & Supply
Culvert
Diameter 20 ft/ft 24 ft/ft 20 ft/ft 24 ft/ft
12" 5.79 5.79 No Bid No Bid
15" 6.50 6.50 No Bid No Bid
18" 8.00 8.00 No Bid No Bid
24" 13.75 13.75 No Bid No Bid
30" 20.00 20.00 No Bid No Bid
36" 25.50 25.50 No Bid No Bid
42" 35.00 35.00 No Bid No Bid

48" 45.00 45.00 No Bid No Bid



BIDS OPENED SEPTEMBER 21, 2015 @ 2:30 P.M. FOR FY 2015-2016

2016-03

2016-03
continued

Corrugated Metal Pipe
Gage

Diameter/
Span-Rise
15"

18"

24"

30"

36"

42"

48"

54"

60"

66"

72"

78"

84"
17"x13"
21"x15"
24"x18"
28"x20"
35"x24"
42"x29"
49"x33"
57"x36"
64"x43"
71"x47"
77"x52"
83"x57"

Corrugated Metal Pipe
Gage

Diameter/
Span-Rise
15"

18"

24"

30"

36"

42"

48"

54"

60"

66"

72"

78"

84"
17"x13"
21"x15"
24"x18"

14
14
14
14
14
14
14
14
12
12
12
12
10
14
14
14
14
14
14
14
14
14
12
12
10

14
14
14
14
14
14
14
14
12
12
12
12
10
14
14
14

Plain

11.50
13.85
18.40
23.00
27.70
32.30
36.95
41.50
62.00
68.50
84.70
91.00
126.00
12.40
14.90
17.40
19.90
24.90
29.80
34.80
39.80
44.80
67.00
73.80
97.30

Plain

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

BCCM

13.50
16.30
21.70
27.00
32.50
38.00
43.40
48.90
73.30
80.60
99.65
107.00
148.50
14.59
16.96
19.78
22.62
28.30
33.87
39.55
45.23
50.91
76.14
83.87
110.57

BCCM

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Harvey Culvert

BCCMPI

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Southern Pipe & Supply

BCCMPI

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Page

CSFCM

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

CSFCM

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

of
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2016-03
continued

2016-03
continued

Corrugated Metal Pipe
Gage

Diameter/
Span-Rise
28"x20"
35"x24"
42"x29"
49"x33"
57"x36"
64"x43"
71"x47"
77"x52"
83"x57"

Corrugated Metal Pipe
Gage

Diameter/
Span-Rise
15"

18"

24"

30"

36"

42"

48"

54"

60"

66"

72"

78"

84"
17"x13"
21"x15"
24"x18"
28"x20"
35"x24"
42"x29"
49"x33"
57"x36"
64"x43"
71"x47"
77"x52"
83"x57"

14
14
14
14
14
14
12
12
10

14
14
14
14
14
14
14
14
12
12
12
12
10
14
14
14
14
14
14
14
14
14
12
12
10

Plain

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Plain

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Southern Pipe & Supply

BCCM

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Contech
BCCM

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

BCCMPI

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

BCCMPI

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

Page

CSFCM

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

CSFCM

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
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2016-04

2016-05

Class 3 Reinforced Concrete Pipe

Diameter
12"
15"
18"
24"
30"
36"
42"
48"
54"
60"

Lightweight Aggregate (LWA)
Trinity Industries, Inc.

Material Livingston, AL

(Stone) cY

LWA 33.00

Page

Harvey Culvert

4' Sec/ft
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A
N/A

8' Sec/ft
No Bid
12.29
14.90
22.16
31.83
41.69
50.75
68.49
87.30
109.14

4

of

Southern Pipe & Supply

4' Sec/ft
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

8' Sec/ft
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid



BIDS OPENED SEPTEMBER 21, 2015 @ 2:30 P.M. FOR FY 2015-2016

2016-6

Page

Traffic Stripe Ozark Striping Company

0-5 Miles
Solid White, Class 1 Type A No Bid
Broken Yellow, Class 1 Type A No Bid
Solid Yellow, Class 1 Type A No Bid
Solid White, Class 2 Type A No Bid
Solid Yellow, Class 2 Type A No Bid
Broken Yellow, Class 2 Type A No Bid
Broken Temporary No Bid
Solid Temporary No Bid

0-250 SF
Traffic Control Markings, Class 2 Type A No Bid
Traffic Control Legends, Class 2 Type A No Bid

0-250 LF
Solid White, Class 2, Type A Rumble Strip, 6" No Bid
Solid White, Class 2, Type A Rumble Strip, 5" No Bid

0-250 Each
Pavement Markers, Class A, Type 1-B No Bid
Pavement Markers, Class A, Type 2-D No Bid
Notes:

Class 1 striping must be > $2,500 per work order.
Class 2 striping must be > $7,500 per work order.

5 of 5
6-10 Miles  11-20 Miles 20+ Miles
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid

251-500 SF 501-750 SF 750+ SF
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid

251-500 LF  501-750 LF 750+ LF
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
251-500 Each 501-750 Each 750+ Each
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid

Class 2T striping must be > $7,500 per work order & will be shot at 60 mil.
Markings and Legends or Rumble Strip orders must be > $1,500 per work order.

Temporary Traffic Stripe must be > $1,000 per work order.
Pavement Markers must be > $1,250 per work order.
Cleaning/sweeping/washing roadways, clipping shoulders, and
debris removal not included.

14 day advance notice required.

Requests work orders come in 10 mile minimumes.

Requests minimum 14 days to complete work orders.

Highlighted bids are the apparent low responsible bid (raw) and/or bid

appearing to be lowest overall cost to Sumter County.



